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Alerts

1 event
26 results matching for 'Applications for Amendment' during July 2011.

Number Title Date
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2003285452 Aqueous adhesive composition based on legume starch 13 Jul 2011

2004237193 Gimbal assembly for optical imaging system 13 Jul 2011

2004258210 Prestressed, strong foam glass tiles 13 Jul 2011

2004283850 Multispecific deimmunized CD3-binders 13 Jul 2011

2005222518 Constitutive expression cassettes for regulation of plant expression 13 Jul 2011

2005237411 Orally disintegrating tablets and methods of manufacture 13 Jul 2011

2005246952 Method for overcoming system administration blockage 13 Jul 2011

2005248856 Flow monitoring system for a flow control apparatus 13 Jul 2011

2005263138 Wind energy extraction system 13 Jul 2011

2005263416 Process for preparing monomers and polymers thereof 13 Jul 2011

2005269995 Pharmaceutical composition comprising FGF18 and IL-1 antagonist and method of use 13 Jul 2011

2005309289 System and method for providing operator-differentiated messaging to a wireless user
equipment (UE) device

13 Jul 2011

2006205456 Film roll 13 Jul 2011

2006205932 Motorized watercraft with a control device 13 Jul 2011

2006213775 Neutralizing monoclonal antibodies against severe acute respiratory syndrome-associated
coronavirus

13 Jul 2011

2006217540 Ocaperidone salts and pharmaceutical compositions containing the same 13 Jul 2011

2006251137 Method for mounting a safety line cable on a tensioning device 13 Jul 2011

2006254742 Method and composition for transdermal drug delivery 13 Jul 2011

2006259326 Catalyst for hydrogen production from water gas shift reaction 13 Jul 2011

2006260163 Method of designing both-plane aspherical progressive refractive power lens group and
both-plane aspherical progressive refractive power lens group

13 Jul 2011

2006350395 Wireless communication system 13 Jul 2011

2007238578 Percutaneous facet fusion system and method 13 Jul 2011

2008236110 Welded component comprising seamless bent pipe and seamless straight pipe sections and
methods of manufacturing thereof

13 Jul 2011

2008248723 Energy absorption device for multisection vehicles 13 Jul 2011

2008290108 Rotor drive mechanism and pump device 13 Jul 2011

2011201713 Core drill bit with extended matrix height 13 Jul 2011
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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